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ICELAND’S WESTFJORDS & NORTH COAST 9 DAY EXPEDITION CRUISE

Welcome to Aurora Expeditions' Iceland's Westfjords & North
Coast Discovery voyage. Geologically, Iceland is one of the
youngest countries on Earth. It's a land of spectacular geology
that is rich in wildlife, culture and human history. On this
voyage, you'll explore Westfjords, one of the remotest and most
pristine regions in Iceland--ideal for nature hikes and bird and
whale viewing. Discover diverse landscapes including thundering
waterfalls, lava fields that breath steam and verdant valleys that
stretch beyond the horizon. In Husavik, keep your eyes and
cameras ready to catch the fluke of a whale tail as it takes a
deep dive. Atlantic puffins can be found in large numbers in
Iceland, and you'll have many opportunities to encounter these
charismatic birds nesting in their burrows. _Note: In order to
experience some of the incredible scenery of Iceland, a number
of the shore excursions on this itinerary require coach travel
away from the coast. _

ITINERARY

Day 1 Arrive Reykjavik

Having made your way to Reykjavik, you will be met by a
representative of Aurora Expeditions and transferred to our
group hotel. Upon arrival at your included hotel, please visit the
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Aurora Expeditions hospitality desk to collect your luggage cabin
tags and to speak with our ground operations team, who may
have information to share with you about pre-embarkation or to
provide you with information about where to dine, withdraw cash
or purchase last minute items from a local pharmacy or
supermarket.

The remainder of your time is at leisure. All meals today are at
your own expense.

Accommodation: Fosshotel Reykjavik Hotel (or similar)

Day 2 Embarkation Day

Breakfast and check-out. Join our guided Golden Circle and
Geothermal Energy tour. With 85% of its electricity sourced from
renewable sources, Iceland sets an outstanding example when it
comes to sustainable energy.

Our journey takes us to the famous seismic sights of the Golden
Circle route - Gullfoss waterfall, geysir, and history-rich
Thingvellir National Park, before we experience first-hand how
green, sustainable energy is produced at one of the largest
single-site geothermal power plants on the planet at the
Geothermal Energy Exhibition and Ljosafossvirkjun Power
Station.

We'll also spend time at a true eco-village. Powered with
thermal and solar energy, Solheimar is fully sustainable,

boasting greenhouses and forestry programmes, while its
sustainable workshops are dedicated to candle-making,
carpentry, weaving and soap-making. Late afternoon we return
to Reykjavik for embarkation.

This evening, get to know your fellow expeditioners, expedition
team and crew.

Day 3 - Arnarstapi / Grundafjordur

At Arnarstapi, our Zodiacs tender us ashore. Located on the
Snaefellsnes Peninsula, this area features diverse landscapes
characterised by lava fields, glistening fjords and home to
Breidafjordur Bay which is rich in birdlife. The area is crowned by
the magnificent, ice-capped Snaefellsjokull volcano, a
700,000-year-old dormant subglacial volcano, visible from
Reykjavik on a clear day and immortalised in Jules Verne's
Journey to the Centre of the Earth. You can choose from a
selection of shore excursion options that best suits your
interests and level of fitness. Options include a bus tour to
Mount Kirkjufell, one of the most famous mountains in Iceland,
or a choice of hikes including a glacier hike at Snaefellsjokull
Glacier.

Day 4-5 Westfjords

Over the next two days, we explore the Westfjords region
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featuring outstanding landscapes with jaw-dropping views of
dramatic fjords carved by ancient glaciers, sheer table
mountains that plunge into the sea and pristine North Atlantic
vegetation.

At Patreksfjordur, a shore excursion by coach takes us to
Latrabjarg cliffs. As Europe's largest bird cliff, Latrabjarg is home
to millions of seabirds, such as puffin, razorbill, fulmar and
guillemot. Enjoy the impressive variety of natural wonders and
unspoiled nature. Latrabjarg also happens to be the
westernmost point in Europe, east coast of the North American
continent on the other side of the Atlantic. Alternatively, enjoy a
shore excursion by coach to Rauthasnduris to explore the beach
and seal watching.

At Dynjandi, witness one of Iceland's most impressive waterfalls
- a difficult feat in a country that is filled with spectacular
cascading falls.

Day 6 Husavik & Akureyri

Arrive in Husavik, the whale watching capital of Iceland. Choose
from a selection of shore excursions to best suit your interests
and level of fitness. Choose to visit Godafoss Falls and soak at
Myvatn Nature baths, an outdoor hot spring bathing complex
surrounded by mountain views. Alternatively, explore both
Godafoss and Dettifoss waterfalls, the Mývatn region and Krafla.

In the evening, we reboard our vessel in Akureyri, Iceland's

second largest city outside the capital area and is blessed with
a superb snow-capped mountain backdrop.

Day 7 Siglufjordur

Siglufjordur is the northernmost town on Iceland's mainland and
is a historic fishing town whose fortune has been closely linked
to the success of the fishing industry. It's an area of spectacular
natural beauty surrounded by mountains and the fjord. In the
morning, our expedition team will lead you on a guided hike
suited to your level of fitness. After lunch, you'll have free time
to explore this quaint town at your leisure, visiting the numerous
galleries, museums, artisanal workshops and local church. If
we're lucky, we might get to taste some local beer.

Day 8 Vigur Island

On Vigur Island, birdwatchers can try and tick a few species on
their list, while others can enjoy walks and hikes of varying
levels of difficulty, soaking in the stunning surrounds.

Day 9 Disembark Reykjavik

During the early morning, we cruise into Reykjavik and
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disembark at approximately 8.00 am. Farewell your expedition
team and fellow passengers as you continue your onward
journey. Transfer to Keflavik airport or to your centrally located
hotel.

**Note: We do not recommend booking flights departing prior
to 12.00 pm on the day of disembarkation, as we may
experience delays at the conclusion of the voyage.**

Please Note:

In true expedition style we encourage exploration and adventure,
offering flexibility in challenging environments in a way that puts
you among the action to see and do as much as possible. This
itinerary is only a guide and subject to change due to ice and
weather conditions.
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YOUR SHIP: SYLVIA EARLE

YOUR SHIP: Sylvia Earle

VESSEL TYPE:

LENGTH:

PASSENGER CAPACITY:

BUILT/REFURBISHED:

Sylvia Earle made her inaugural cruise in 2022; she honours the
highly accomplished marine biologist, oceanographer and
explorer, Sylvia Earle. As the first female chief scientist of the
U.S. National Oceanic and Atmospheric Administration, and
named by Time Magazine as its first Hero for the Planet in 1998
- this vessel pays tribute to Sylvia's long standing conservation
efforts for marine protected areas and ocean wildlife. Sylvia
Earle will be actively involved in the development of her
namesake. The streamlined Ulstein X-BOW® cuts through the
swell so you feel fewer vibrations and disturbances, and makes
quicker transits through waves. It also helps reduce fuel
consumption by up to 60%^. Experience the Glass Atrium
Lounge inside the bow, featuring huge windows and superb
views to the front of the ship. In between landings, enjoy the
heated saltwater open air swimming pool and jacuzzis on board
the Sylvia Earle and watch the world go by, or experience our
gym, sauna or enjoy a massage (additional cost) in the
Wellness centre. Sylvia Earle carries many Zodiacs, which you
can board via four dedicated, sea-level launching platforms.
These platforms make boarding the Zodiacs as quick, efficient
and safe as possible, minimising wait times and getting you

closer to the action for longer. Dining One of the most important
parts of any expedition is the food! Whatever adventures the
day holds, you will be fuelled-up with hearty meals and
delicious morning/afternoon teas cooked by our onboard chefs.
Meals are a great time to soak up the expedition camaraderie in
our open seating dining area. Share stories with your fellow
travellers and ask our expedition team questions that may have
come up during the day. Tea, coffee and snacks are available
24 hours a day, and our chefs offer different menu options and
courses for each meal. Enjoy the range of house wine, beers
and soft drinks included with dinner after a long day in the wild.
We also invite you to join your captain and expedition team for
informal Captain's Welcome and Farewell drinks, with
complimentary beverages and cocktail appetisers, followed by a
3 course meal. Responsible Travel We believe that preserving
and protecting the environment is of the utmost importance and
this is reflected in several features of the Sylvia Earle. The Sylvia
Earle will boast one of the lowest polluting marine engines in the
world due to low energy consumption, high fuel-efficiency and a
streamlined design to deliver an 80% reduction in emissions.
The ship can also utilise virtual anchoring to hold its position
using a combination of GPS, steering technology, propellers and
thrusters. This protects the sea floor and minimises the damage
caused by conventional anchors. Compared to Tier
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1 engines.
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INSIDE YOUR SHIP

Aurora Stateroom Superior Aurora Stateroom Triple Share

Balcony Stateroom Category A Balcony Stateroom Category B

Balcony Stateroom Category C Balcony Stateroom Superior

Captain’s Suite Junior Suite
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PRICING

28-Jul-2025 to 05-Aug-2025

Captain’s Suite £15246 GBP pp

Balcony Stateroom Category A £9330 GBP pp

Balcony Stateroom Category C £8310 GBP pp

Balcony Stateroom Superior £10248 GBP pp

Aurora Stateroom Superior £8055 GBP pp

Junior Suite £12849 GBP pp

Aurora Stateroom Triple Share £7392 GBP pp

Balcony Stateroom Category B £8769 GBP pp


