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ICELAND CIRCUMNAVIGATION CRUISE ABOARD SEAVENTURE

Experience an unforgettable journey around Iceland onboard the
SEAVENTURE. Discover this mystical land steeped in Viking
traditions and volcanic landscapes rarely seen anywhere else on
earth. This voyage reveals a diverse array of natural wonders
and the Icelandic way of life. A range of exciting shore
excursions offers countless ways to interact with Iceland's
culture, nature, history and people. After departing from
beautiful Reykjavik we will visit the remote and wild Snaefellsnes
Peninsula, Isafjordur, an idyllic town in the Westfjords region,
the wonderful bird island of Flatey, the whale watching centre of
Husavik, the picturesque port of Seydisfjordur and the Westman
Islands. We also have the choice of optional visits to the
Vatnajokull Glacier or a four wheel-drive Jeep tour or take a boat
trip in the Jokulsarlon glacier Lagoon amongst others. ITINERARY

Day 1 Reykjavik

Our optional Air & Ground package provides a convenient
arrival. Use your leisure time in Reykjavik to discover the unique
charm of the world's northernmost capital. The SEAVENTURE
docks in Old Reykjavik Harbor in the heart of the city, a
five-minute stroll from the main squares, shopping and dining.
The ship departs in the evening.

Day 2 Snaefellsnes Peninsula

The area is often referred to as "Iceland in miniature", through
its diversity of landscapes. Breidafjordur Bay, for instance, is
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known for its fascinating bird life, unique basalt formations and
breathtaking panorama.

Day 3 Isafjordur

Today's destination is Isafjordur, an idyllic town in the
Westfjords region. This secluded peninsula is connected to the
Icelandic mainland by only a narrow strip of land and includes
many roadless areas where cars have never been. The
landscape includes jaw-dropping views of dramatic fjords
carved by ancient glaciers, sheer table mountains that plunge
into the sea and pristine North Atlantic vegetation.

Day 4 Siglufjordur/Flatey/Husavik

By morning we reach the fjord town of Siglufjordur, once the hub
of the global herring industry and now enjoying a rebirth in
popularity. Learn about the golden age of herring at the
award-winning Herring Era Museum located on the vibrant
harbour-front. In the early afternoon we head to Flatey. It's a
natural haven for birdlife and home to the arctic tern and
puffins, which can be observed at close quarters. During dinner
we steam further into the Skjalfandi Bay and visit Husavik.

Day 5 Husavik

Husavik is often called the "Whale watching capital" of Iceland.
The town's offshore waters are home to 15 different whale
species, as well as dolphins and 30 variety of birds. Watching
these graceful ocean giants in their Arctic habitat is an

unforgettable experience.

Day 6 Seydisfjördur

Iceland's East Fjords are best explored from the impossibly
picturesque port of Seydisfjordur, nestled between the sea and
steep mountains. Activities include hiking, horseback riding and
exploring the natural beauties of the East.

Day 7 Djupivogur

The fishing village of Djupivogur is today's starting point to
explore the Berufjordur fjord by kayak ( optional). Go on a four
wheel-drive Jeep tour ( optional) or take a boat trip in the
Jokulsarlon Glacier Lagoon (optional). Icebergs of all shapes
and sizes are floating in the water - an unforgettable adventure.

Day 8 Vestmannaeyjar (Westman Islands)

Located off Iceland's South Coast, the Westman Islands were
formed by submarine volcanic eruptions around 10,000 years
ago. We go ashore on Heimaey, the only inhabited island, where
half-buried houses remain from a violent 1973 eruption.

Day 9 Reykjavik

After breakfast we bid farewell to the SEAVENTURE as we sail
back into Reykjavik. Explore inland areas like the Golden Circle
and its famous Gullfoss waterfall or other post-cruise programs.
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Or simply hang out in Reykjavik, a perfect city for those who
want to refresh their spirit in a place that combines invigorating
outdoor activities, great food and world-class entertainment.

_Please note: The arrival and departure times depend on
weather conditions. We strongly recommend that you do not
book your departure flights before 02:00 p.m._

Please Note:

Itineraries are subject to change.
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YOUR SHIP: SEAVENTURE

YOUR SHIP: Seaventure

VESSEL TYPE:

LENGTH:

PASSENGER CAPACITY:

BUILT/REFURBISHED:

A WORLD-CLASS SMALL SHIP EXPERIENCE Seaventure features
a 1-A Super ice class rating -- the highest ice class awarded to
passenger vessels. This means that we will be able to explore
coves, bays, and channels that would previously have been
forbidden to us. The ship also offers a host of new activities.
There's a sauna, a fitness center, a custom-built citizen science
lab, and heated saltwater pool. There is more storage space,
which is important because it means we can carry more
equipment, so that more of our guests can participate in
activities like kayaking, snowshoeing, and camping. The
common areas are larger and beautifully appointed, and the
ship has two. Antarctica is a uniquely challenging environment,
one that Seaventure is supremely prepared for. Its
state-of-the-art stabilizing system provides safe, comfortable
passage through even rough seas, and its ice rating is
second-to-none in these waters. This means Seaventure can
usher you into places (and amazing experiences) that regularly
turn away lesser and larger ships. Seaventure features an outer
viewing deck that circles the entire ship, and an outdoor dining
area and heliport where we host events whenever weather
permits. Indoors, our elegant dining areas and spacious

presentation room surround you with oversized windows, so
you'll never have to miss a passing iceberg or an impromptu
sighting of a Humpback or school of Orcas. Even our treadmills
and ellipticals keep your eyes trained on the mesmerizing
Antarctic landscape. Ship Facilities: Two Elevators serving all
passenger decks Library with computers Fitness Center and
Sauna Heated saltwater swimming pool Citizen Science
Laboratory All Staterooms Feature: Exterior views Sitting area
with chairs or sofa and table Complimentary Mini-Bar Flat
Screen TV Telephone Safe to store your valuables Independent
temperature controls Luxury toiletries

Hair dryer
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INSIDE YOUR SHIP
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PRICING

ADDITIONAL CHARGES:
Government Tax payable on board
- approx 54 GBP pp


