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EDINBURGH TO PORTSMOUTH - 13 DAY SCOTLAND EXPEDITION CRUISE

This voyage promises everything from regal pomp to historic
islands and breathtaking natural beauty. Begin below the gaze
of mighty Edinburgh Castle before embarking on an epic journey
to England’s south coast. Remarkable islands reveal cinematic
scenery, throngs of calling seabirds, and monuments from
antiquity. Hike, cruise and crunch through some of the UK’s
finest scenery under the knowledgeable guidance of the
Endeavour’s experts.

ITINERARY

Day 1 Pre Cruise

Day 2 Edinburgh (Leith)

Edinburgh is to London as poetry is to prose, as Charlotte Brontë
once wrote. One of the world's stateliest cities and proudest
capitals, it's built—like Rome—on seven hills, making it a striking
backdrop for the ancient pageant of history. In a skyline of sheer
drama, Edinburgh Castle watches over the capital city, frowning
down on Princes Street’s glamour and glitz. But despite its rich
past, the city’s famous festivals, excellent museums and
galleries, as well as the modern Scottish Parliament, are
reminders that Edinburgh has its feet firmly in the 21st
century.Nearly everywhere in Edinburgh (the burgh is always
pronounced burra in Scotland) there are spectacular buildings,
whose Doric, Ionic, and Corinthian pillars add touches of
neoclassical grandeur to the largely Presbyterian backdrop.
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Large gardens are a strong feature of central Edinburgh, where
the city council is one of the most stridently conservationist in
Europe. Arthur's Seat, a mountain of bright green and yellow
furze, rears up behind the spires of the Old Town. This child-size
mountain jutting 822 feet above its surroundings has steep
slopes and little crags, like a miniature Highlands set down in
the middle of the busy city. Appropriately, these theatrical
elements match Edinburgh's character—after all, the city has
been a stage that has seen its fair share of romance, violence,
tragedy, and triumph.Modern Edinburgh has become a cultural
capital, staging the Edinburgh International Festival and the
Fringe Festival in every possible venue each August. The
stunning Museum of Scotland complements the city’s wealth of
galleries and artsy hangouts. Add Edinburgh’s growing
reputation for food and nightlife and you have one of the world’s
most beguiling cities.Today the city is the second most
important financial center in the United Kingdom, and the fifth
most important in Europe. The city regularly is ranked near the
top in quality-of-life surveys. Accordingly, New Town apartments
on fashionable streets sell for considerable sums. In some
senses the city is showy and materialistic, but Edinburgh still
supports learned societies, some of which have their roots in the
Scottish Enlightenment. The Royal Society of Edinburgh, for
example, established in 1783 "for the advancement of learning
and useful knowledge," remains an important forum for
interdisciplinary activities.Even as Edinburgh moves through the
21st century, its tall guardian castle remains the focal point of
the city and its venerable history. Take time to explore the
streets—peopled by the spirits of Mary, Queen of Scots; Sir
Walter Scott; and Robert Louis Stevenson—and pay your
respects to the world's best-loved terrier, Greyfriars Bobby. In
the evenings you can enjoy candlelit restaurants or a folk ceilidh

(pronounced kay-lee, a traditional Scottish dance with music),
though you should remember that you haven't earned your
porridge until you've climbed Arthur's Seat. Should you wander
around a corner, say, on George Street, you might see not an
endless cityscape, but blue sea and a patchwork of fields. This
is the county of Fife, beyond the inlet of the North Sea called the
Firth of Forth—a reminder, like the mountains to the northwest
that can be glimpsed from Edinburgh's highest points, that the
rest of Scotland lies within easy reach.

Day 3 Farne Islands & Lindisfarne Island

His favourite place in the UK to see nature at its best, is how
David Attenborough described the Farne Islands. The scatter of
small islands begins 2.4 kilometres (1.5 miles) off the
Northumberland Coast. The islands are dolerite which formed
from liquid rock cooling underground. Softer overlying rock has
eroded to leave hard rounded columns and fissured dolerite
cliffs. The treeless landscape makes viewing of the island
wildlife and history easy, even from a boat. The Farnes are cared
for by the National Trust. In Medieval times the Inner Farnes
were home of the famous hermit bishop Saint Cuthbert. In 676
CE he introduced laws to protect the Eider Ducks—one of the
earliest written bird protection laws in the world. Locally, Eider
Ducks are known as Cuddy’s in honour of the saint. Historic
buildings that can be spotted include St Cuthbert’s Chapel, a
stone Pele lookout tower and two standing lighthouses. With
100,000 breeding seabirds and thousands of seals, the natural
reputation of the Farnes is clear. Atlantic Puffins are the most
common bird during their April to July breeding season when
they raise their pufflings. The puffin is called the Tommy noddy
in Northumberland. Other birds include Common Guillemots and
Arctic Terns. Grey Seals drop pups here in winter, while in the
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summer you can see them in and on the islands. Common now,
the seals were once hunted for food by monks. Birds were
special to monks, but seals were classified as fish (not
mammals) and thus fair game. Not now! The island of
Lindisfarne, otherwise known as Holy Island, was a destination
for religious pilgrims. It was perhaps the holiest site in
Anglo-Saxon England. Now many visitors are more interested in
history and recreation. Most arrive by driving on a causeway
from the Northumberland mainland, but only at low tide. The
island has an intertidal boat harbour, a castle, a ruined priory
and a village of less than 200 folks. A priory (small monastery)
was established on Lindisfarne in 635 CE by Aidan, an Irish
monk based at Iona Island in Scotland. The priory was a base
for Christianity for northern England. Cuthbert joined the
monastery and became abbot and, after death, a saint and
subject of pilgrimages. An account of him residing at Lindisfarne
is the oldest known piece of English writing. Vikings raided the
wealthy Linisfarne monastery in 793 CE in their first major attack
on western Europe. Fear spread throughout the land. The monks
abandoned the island for 400 years, before returning to revive
the religious centre post-Vikings. The stone ruins of Lindisfarne
Priory can be observed near the island’s village. Lindisfarne
Castle is small compared to other castles, but you can see how
it dominates the island from all directions. It was built in 1550
using some of the stones of the priory and is in good condition.
The castle, with adjacent gardens and lime kilns, is cared for by
the National Trust. Lindisfarne mead made on the island is
touted as an aphrodisiac. What would the monks think?

Day 4 Fair Isle, Scotland

Lying mid-way between Shetland and the Orkney islands, Fair
Isle is a tiny jewel in the sea. Famous for birds, knitwear and

historic shipwrecks, the island offers a warm and friendly
welcome to visitors. With a population of only around 70 people
this island is truly a beautiful setting and is one of Britain’s most
successful communities. View the cloudy light turquoise water
as it drifts out to sea beneath the breath-taking Sheep Rock,
rising over 100 metres, which is almost an isle of its own. Fair
Isles oceanic climate brings stormy but fairly mild winters, in
summer, you can expect rapid changes in the weather, sparkling
sunshine can be followed by a thick blanket of mist and fog,
and this makes the isle a truly inspiring area. Over the centuries
the island has changed hands many times and was named the
island of peace by Norse settlers. The isle has been a useful
landmark for shipping but in storms and fog it is highly
dangerous creating over 100 known shipwrecks such as the
Spanish armada flag ship “El Gran Grifon”.

Day 5 St. Kilda & Boreray Island cruising

Gloriously remote, St. Kilda is an archipelago 50 miles off the
Isle of Harris. Although the four islands are uninhabited by
humans, thousands of seas birds call these craggy cliffs home,
clinging to the sheer faces as if by magic. Not only is St. Kilda
home to the UK’s largest colony of Atlantic Puffin (almost 1
million), but also the world largest colony Gannets nests on
Boreray island and its sea stacks. The islands also home
decedents of the world’s original Soay sheep as well as having a
breed of eponymously named mice. The extremely rare St. Kilda
wren unsurprisingly hails from St. Kilda, so birders should visit
with notebook, binoculars and camera to hand. While endemic
animal species is rife on the island, St. Kilda has not been
peopled since 1930 after the last inhabitants voted that human
life was unsustainable. However, permanent habitation had
been possible in the Medieval Ages, and a vast National Trust
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for Scotland project to restore the dwellings is currently being
undertaken. The islands even enjoyed a status as being an ideal
holiday destination in the 19th century. Today, the only humans
living on the islands are passionate history, science and
conservation scholars. One of the caretakers even acts as
shopkeeper and postmaster for any visitors who might like to
send a postcard home from St. Kilda. It should be noted that St.
Kilda is the UKs only (and just one of 39 in the world) dual
World Heritage status from UNESCO in recognition of its Natural
Heritage and cultural significance. As an isolated island of the
remote St Kilda Group, Boreray island is one of the most far
flung and weather impacted islands of the North East Atlantic.
Imagine trying to live here during stormy weather. Landing
requires jumping or swimming ashore; and yet the island has
been lived on or visited from Neolithic times. Collecting seabirds
and their eggs, and storing them for winter, may have been even
more important than raising sheep. Boreray Sheep are the rarest
breed of sheep in Britain. They evolved from short-tailed sheep
brought from the Scottish mainland but have been isolated long
enough to have evolved into a distinctive small and horned
breed. Only found on Boreray Island, they remained as a wild
flock when the last people left the St Kilda Islands in 1930. The
Souy are a separate and different breed of sheep found on the
other St Kilda Islands. Look out for the Boreray Sheep grazing on
the slopes of hilly Boreray Island. Seabirds thrive on Boreray
and its two attendant rocks stacks, raising new chicks each
summer. Northern Gannets glide overhead as they attempt
difficult landings at nest sites. Seeing gannets plunge from a
great height into the sea is an exciting way to understand the
effort required to feed themselves and chicks. Northern Fulmers
nest on the volcanic rock cliffs and Atlantic Puffins fly in and out
of burrow-strewn slopes. Boreray is part of the St Kilda World

Heritage Site, a rare example of a site recognised for both its
outstanding natural and cultural values.

Day 6 Shiant Islands, Scotland & Dunvegan, Isle of Skye, Scotland

Cliffs of tall hexagonal columns create a sensational landscape
at the Shiant Islands, especially when viewed from the sea. The
cliffs of six-sided rock columns look like the cross-section of an
enormous honeycomb. The rock formations were formed when
molten volcanic magma cooled very slowly underground.
Millions of years of erosion has exposed the six-sided columns
to the sea, and to us. The tallest of these formations is 120
metres (390 feet) high. During spring and summer, flights of
seabirds near the Shiant Islands catch the eye. Many
long-winged seabirds wheel and soar gracefully. Others are
more shaped for underwater swimming and fly in direct lines,
beating stubby wings to resemble flying potatoes. Some birds
nest in burrows while others, like Black-legged Kittiwakes, nest
on cliffs. Rather than build nests, guillemots lay eggs on bare
rock ledges. The pointed shape of the eggs ensures they roll in a
tight circle, not off the ledge to the sea below. The Shiant
Islands are part of the Outer Hebrides and located between the
Isles of Lewis and Skye. Historically, they have supported
families of sheep grazers who could tolerate a lonely island
outpost. The Shiants were known as the last place in Britain
where the Black Rat occurred in substantial numbers. Originally
introduced to Britain from Asia in Roman times these rodents
caused problems, eating eggs and chicks of seabirds. A
successful eradication program eliminated the rats in 2016,
giving the seabird colonies well-earned peace. Skye epitomizes
Scotland's wild celtic appeal. A turbulent geological history has
given this beautiful, rugged island some of Britain's most varied
and dramatic scenery. Steeped in mystery, romance and
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adventure, the Isle of Skye is perhaps the most well-known of
Scotland's many islands. Charles Edward Stuart, better known
as Bonnie Prince Charlie, escaped here from the mainland
disguised as a maidservant of a woman by the name of Flora
MacDonald. The north of the island is dominated by a rugged
volcanic plateau, the south by the Cuillins mountain range,
whose peaks were sculpted by the glaciers of the Ice Age. Skye
is divided by numerous sea lochs allowing continuous proximity
to the sea. The limestone grasslands of the south are the home
of sheep and cattle. Scattered about are ruins of crofts, small
holdings used for grazing; they were abandoned as their owners
fell into poverty due to lack of income. Dunvegan is situated in a
sheltered sea loch, or fjord, on the northwestern coast of the
island on the Waternish peninsula. The small settlement is
dominated by Dunvegan Castle. The oldest inhabited castle in
Scotland, it has been the seat of the chiefs of the Clan MacLeod
for the past 700 years. It offers insights into Scotland's clan
spirit with paintings and relics from the MacLeod Clan. The
gardens were originally laid out in the 18th century and are of
considerable interest with the woodland glades, shimmering
pools and a multitude of rhododendrons. Loch Dunvegan is
home to a seal colony; the two main varieties are the brown seal
and the great gray Atlantic seal. Small local boats depart from
the jetty at frequent intervals throughout the day enabling close
observation of these playful sea mammals.

Day 7 Fort William, Scotland

Flanked by the UK’s tallest mountain on one side and Loch
Linnae on the other, Fort William – or “Bill” to the locals – is
what you imagine when it comes to Scottish Highland towns.
Verdant moors stretch as far as the eye can see, pastel painted
houses front the water and it is not unusual to see pipers in kilts

on street corners. But while Fort William may play to certain
critics’ idea of a cliché, the pretty town goes far beyond tartan
cushions and wee drams of Scotch (although there is a fair
amount of this too!). Fort William has everything you could
possibly want while in the Highlands. The High Street has plenty
to keep you occupied with its good range of shops, cafes and
restaurants - a lunch of locally caught seafood or the iconic
haggis, neeps and tatties is a must. Because of its privileged
location sitting in the shadow of the mighty Ben Nevis (standing
a proud 1,345 metres high) outdoor enthusiasts are especially
well catered for. Unsurprisingly so, as Fort William is considered
the UK’s outdoor capital. But it’s not all high adrenaline sports.
Certainly, those who want to climb up a rock or hurtle down
white water rapids will find their nirvana, but if gentle fishing, a
quiet county walk or curling up in cosy pubs warmed by an open
fire are more your glass of whiskey then you’re catered for. The
West Highland Museum in the centre of the town is excellent,
while St Andrew's Church, towards the north end of the main
street, has a very attractive interior. Also well worth a look is St
Mary's Catholic Church, on Belford Road, and no visit should be
considered complete without a look at the Old Fort, almost
invisible to passing traffic. Add a wildlife cruise amid stunning
scenery and the steam train that took Harry to Hogwarts and you
can easily spend a day in this lovely port.

Day 8 Iona & Lunga

If tiny islands that resonate with peace and tranquillity are your
idea of travel heaven, then welcome to Iona. Almost 200 miles
east of Edinburgh, set in Scotland’s Inner Hebrides, this magical
island has a spiritual reputation that precedes it. And luckily,
more than lives up to. The island is miniscule. Just three miles
long and only one and a half miles wide, this is not a place that
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hums with urban attractions. 120 people call Iona home (this
number rises significantly if the gull, tern and Kittiwake
population is added), although residential numbers do go up (to
a whopping 175) in summer. The beautiful coastline is lapped
by the gulf stream and gives the island a warm climate with
sandy beaches that look more Mediterranean than Scottish!
Add to that a green field landscape that is just beautiful, and
you’ll find that Iona is a place that stays with you long after you
leave. Iona’s main attraction is of course its abbey. Built in 563
by Saint Columbia and his monks, the abbey is the reason why
Iona is called the cradle of Christianity. Not only is the abbey
(today an ecumenical church) one of the best – if not the best –
example of ecclesiastical architecture dating from the Middle
Ages, but it also serves as an important site of spiritual
pilgrimage. St. Martin’s Cross, a 9th century Celtic cross that
stands outside the abbey, is considered as the finest example of
Celtic crosses in the British Isles. Rèilig Odhrain, or the
cemetery, allegedly contains the remains of many Scottish
kings. The stunning Isle of Lunga is the largest island in the
Treshnish archipelago. With volcanic origin the isle was
populated until the 19th Century, and remains of black houses
can be seen around this magnificent coastal jewel. Abundant
plant life and exotic birdlife are now the main inhabitants of the
area. Fortunate visitors view the magnificent array of birds,
especially the great puffins that breed on the islands plateau.
One can sit within just a few feet away without disturbing the
avian ambassador’s peace. The 81 hectare island is home to
many rare and endangered plants such as, primroses and
orchids. Views over the landscape and across the ocean can be
seen from the 300 foot high cliffs.

Day 9 Calf of Man, Isle of Man

There is no calf on the Calf of Man. The name of this small
island adjacent to the Isle of Man has nothing to do with cows.
It is a mispronunciation of the Old Norse word kalfr, meaning a
small island near a larger one. The Isle of Calf is only 250
hectares (618 acres) and is separated from its larger neighbour
by a narrow stretch of water. Four lighthouses were built on the
island and nearby rocks to warn seafarers. Ships hate rocks but
Grey Seals love them for resting upon or swimming amongst.
While there are no calves, there are a few sheep of the Manx
Loaghtan variety, descendants of primitive sheep once found
throughout Scotland and nearby islands. Manx means
‘pertaining to the Isle of Man’. Once a private sheep run, the
island was donated as a bird sanctuary and is now owned by
the Manx National Heritage. Wardens live in the island’s old
farmhouse over summer to protect the wildlife, research birds,
tend the sheep and look out for introduced Brown Rats. The rats
arrived after fleeing a sinking ship in 1871 and became effective
killers of seabird chicks. Seabird numbers have surged following
a recent rat eradication program. Manx Shearwaters breed from
about March to August. They are named after their presence at
the islands and seas surrounding the Isle of Man. The birds only
visit their island nesting burrows at night and so are easier to
spot from the deck of a ship. They glide ever so close to the
surface of the sea as if they are ‘shearing’ the water. A sheer
delight to watch.

Day 10 Tresco, Isles of Scilly

For many visitors Tresco is the most attractive of the Isles of
Scilly. This is especially due to its Abbey Garden, which is home
to thousands of exotic plant species from around 80 different
countries. Plant collector Augustus Smith began the gardens in
the 1830s on the site of an old Benedictine Abbey by
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channelling the weather up and over a network of walled
enclosures built around the Priory ruins. He had three terraces
carved from the rocky south slope and maximised Tresco’s mild
Gulf Stream climate. Even in mid-winter there still are hundreds
of plants flowering here. Another surprising attraction at the
Abbey Garden is the collection of figureheads from ships that
wrecked among the Isles of Scilly.

Day 11 St Peter Port

The picturesque capital of Guernsey proves that you don’t have
to go to the Caribbean for white sand and crystal clear water. St
Peter Port is both wonderfully pretty and atmospheric, full of
blooming floral displays, tiny stone churches and brightly
painted boats. What’s more, summers are mostly sunny and
comfortable, making the weather something you don’t have to
worry about. As the capital of Guernsey, St. Peter Port is where
the “action” is found. This mainly takes the form of strolling the
cobbled streets, stopping every now and then to admire, and
perhaps photograph, the stunning views. Once French (original
name: St. Pierre Port), the town is at least 800 years old, with
the stone castle and maze like streets to prove it. Once you have
made you way up to the ancient castle, make like a local and
find refreshment with a cream tea, washed down perhaps with a
glass of cider! If the weather is on your side, then surely there is
no more invigorating pastime than hiking up to the spectacular
Guernsey cliffs, taking in stunning views of wildflowers, sandy
beaches and English Channel views. For those who want to
spread their wings a little further, the tiny island of Herm is just a
20-minute boat ride away, and homes no cars, one pub, a few
cows, some puffins and about 50 people. Don’t be fooled by St
Peter Port’s nostalgic exterior. The seaside town has made a
name for itself as a foodie heaven, with everything from beach

huts to Michelin starred restaurants offering sumptuous, locally
sourced fare.

Day 12 Portsmouth

Portsmouth also known as Pompey, is home to three hugely
important historic ships, HMS Victory, Nelson's famous flagship
at the battle of Trafalgar, HMS Warrior the first ironclad warship
and the Mary Rose, Henry VIII's warship that sank in the Solent
just off of Southsea Castle. These are all housed at the Historic
Dockyard, home of the Royal Navy and also home to the world’s
first dry dock. The Historic Dockyard is one of the top ten visitor
attractions in the UK. But Portsmouth is not just about history,
the city is a cosmopolitan University city, with much to offer
visitors and residents alike. Portsmouth has a Premier league
football team, a superb seafront area, excellent shopping and a
wide range of restaurants, pubs and bars. Portsmouth UK is
home to the tallest publicly accessible structure in the UK, the
Spinnaker Tower built right on the edge of Portsmouth Harbour
at Gunwharf Quays. Portsmouth Harbour has been used in a
number of films and television programmes such as Tomorrow
Never Dies (James Bond), Oscar and Lucinda, Making Waves,
Silent Witness, Mr Bean and Eastenders. The local area was
used extensively in the filming of Tommy, The Who's rock opera.

Day 13 Post Cruise

Please Note:

Itineraries are subject to change.
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YOUR SHIP: SILVER ENDEAVOUR

YOUR SHIP: Silver Endeavour

VESSEL TYPE:

LENGTH:

PASSENGER CAPACITY:

BUILT/REFURBISHED:

Designed for polar exploration, Silver Endeavour breaks the ice
of luxury expedition travel. Built to PC6 Polar Class
specifications - one of the highest Polar Class classifications
there is - Silver Endeavour revolutionises our expedition
voyages, and allows travel deeper to some of the planet's
farthest flung coasts. Her statistics speak for themselves: from
unrivalled, industry-leading crew-to-guest, zodiac-to-guest and
expert-to-guest ratios, to cutting-edge navigation and
exploration technology and hallmark Silversea comfort make her
the most luxurious expedition ship ever built. Spread over eight
public decks, not only does she feature ample onboard space,
multiple restaurants, plus a huge choice of bars and lounges,
but her large and luxurious suites are some of the best in
expedition cruising. Superbly designed, all her suites feature a
balcony and our highest standards of service thanks to an
impressive crew-to-guest ratio of 1:1. Mud Room Silver
Endeavour's Mud Room is the perfect place to prepare for all
your expedition activities. Spaciously designed, the two mud
rooms are superbly modern, and equipped with state-of-the-art
equipment. Explorer Lounge Strategically located mid-ship on
deck 4, the Explorer Lounge is the operational heart of shore

excursions while onboard. This is where you'll attend your daily
recap and briefing sessions or attend lectures. Connoisseur 's
Corner The Connoisseur's Corner is an indulgent and
sophisticated cigar lounge, where you can enjoy an after dinner
drink in a cosy private club atmosphere. Otium Spa Otium is
where you can relax and unwind, but also where you can enjoy
world class treatments that make sure you look as good as you
feel and that even Venus herself would envy. Observation
Lounge The Observation Lounge offers one of our favourite
vantage points of Silver Endeavour. Plus 270-degree
surrounding glass windows make this immersive venue ideal
whatever time of the day. Beauty Salon Our committed and
competent team of beauty therapists is here to help keep your
hair, nails, skin, and body healthy and happy. Fitness Centre
Whether you are a serious keep fit fanatic or casual athlete,
you'll find what you're looking for in Silver Endeavour's Fitness
Centre. Expertly designed classes and personal training sessions
make sure that you keep in shape. Boutique Located mid-ship
on Deck 5, the Boutique aboard Silver Endeavour means luxury
shopping experiences do not end just because you're at sea!
Carefully selected partners offer a wide selection of the latest
fashions. Pool Deck Surrounded by glazing extended all the way
to the top of the venue, the Pool Deck gives you the feeling of
always being connected to the sea. The glass-enclosed pool
deck is the ideal place to enjoy breathtaking views. Library
Whether you're an avid bibliophile or simply prefer a quiet place
while at sea, it's hard not to fall in love with Silver Endeavour's
onboard library, with its beautiful reference books, comfortable
chairs and
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stunning scenery.
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INSIDE YOUR SHIP

Classic Veranda Suite Deluxe Veranda Suite

Grand Suite Owner's Suite

Premium Veranda Suite Silver Suite
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PRICING

02-May-2025 to 14-May-2025

Deluxe Veranda Suite £9231 GBP pp

Grand Suite £23919 GBP pp

Silver Suite £12903 GBP pp

Premium Veranda Suite £9486 GBP pp

Owner's Suite £31722 GBP pp

Classic Veranda Suite £8109 GBP pp

Superior Veranda Suite £8874 GBP pp


