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BEST OF THE SOUTHERN OCEAN - SOUTH GEORGIA & FALKLANDS PHOTOGRAPHY EXPEDITION

This expedition cruise offers an unparalleled adventure from
Buenos Aires to Ushuaia. It features a rich itinerary with visits to
the Falkland Islands, extensive exploration of South Georgia
Island--a wildlife paradise renowned for its massive populations
of seabirds, elephant seals, and fur seals, as well as the
historical site of Grytviken. The journey is characterized by scenic
wilderness, memorable excursions, expert presentations, and
immersive experiences in some of the most remote corners of
the world, all while navigating the majestic Southern Ocean.

ITINERARY

Day 1: Arrival in Buenos Aires, Argentina (hotel night)

Our adventure starts in Buenos Aires, the capital of Argentina.
Explore this beautiful city and enjoy a good rest in the hotel we
have organized for you. Tomorrow, you will board the Sea Spirit
and sail towards remote Subantarctic islands

Day 2: Welcome Aboard!

Enjoy breakfast at your hotel and get ready for an exciting day.
Today, we set sail on our beautiful Sea Spirit towards the
Subantarctic islands.

Day 3-5: At sea South Atlantic Ocean
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As we sail towards the subantarctic islands, make the most of
your time! Attend our captivating presentations from experts,
familiarize yourself with our Sea Spirit, and get ready for our
arrival at a wildlife paradise.

Day 6-8: Falkland Islands

The remote and sparsely-populated Falkland Islands are a
birders' paradise. The Falklands are also a great place to
observe marine mammals. The waters around the archipelago
are home to cetaceans such as Peale's dolphins and
Commerson's dolphins. Our exact route and exploration
opportunities are dependent on weather among these isolated
and windswept islands.

We also intend to visit the port of Stanley, the charmingly British
capital of the Falkland Islands. Attractions within pleasant
walking distance along the waterfront promenade include the
Falkland Islands Museum, the governor's house, a cathedral
with impressive whalebone arch outside, a war memorial,
quality gift shops, pubs, and views of shipwrecks in the harbor.

Day 9-10: Southern Ocean

From the Falkland Islands we head east toward South Georgia.
We will cross the Antarctic Convergence, the biological boundary
of the Southern Ocean. Briefings, bio-security procedures, and
lectures from our experts prepare you for our arrival in South
Georgia.

Day 11-16: South Georgia Island

This is expedition cruising at its most authentic. Our route and
exploration opportunities in South Georgia are heavily
dependent on the weather conditions we encounter. Our
experienced captain and expedition leader decide the itinerary
and continually adjust plans as conditions and opportunities
warrant. You can be sure that the best possible advantage will
be taken of the circumstances presented to us by nature in this
wild and remote corner of the world. We take every safe
opportunity to go ashore in this amazing place.

South Georgia is a scenic wilderness and an unrivaled paradise
for subantarctic wildlife viewing. The islands are said to host
upwards of 100 million seabirds, including numerous species of
albatross, penguins, prions, petrels and terns. On beaches such
as those at Salisbury Plain and St. Andrews Bay, over 100,000
elephant seals and three million fur seals jostle for space
among innumerable penguins including stately king penguins
and sprightly macaroni penguins. The recently completed rat
eradication program is sure to make this wilderness even more
pristine and rich with birdlife.

The bountiful waters surrounding South Georgia are also
inhabited by an increasing number of whales. The historical
whaling station of Grytviken is now home to the excellent South
Georgia Museum managed by the South Georgia Heritage Trust.
Grytviken is also the final resting place of Ernest Shackleton, the
legendary polar explorer.

Our days in South Georgia are filled with memorable excursions,
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sumptuous meals, presentations by our experts, and enough
incredible scenery and wildlife to fill your camera and overwhelm
your emotions.

Day 17-20: Southern Ocean

As you sail, immerse yourself in fascinating presentations from
our expert staff and bond with fellow travelers. On the open
deck, marvel at the sight of birds and marine mammals that
grace our journey. South polar skuas, snow petrels, and
albatrosses may escort our vessel, enhancing your experience
with their majestic presence. The encounter with sea ice adds a
dramatic backdrop to your adventure. Approaching the Drake
Passage, the seabirds you saw at the beginning of your voyage
reappear, offering a full-circle experience of natural wonder.

Day 21: Disembarkation in Ushuaia, Argentina

After breakfast we say farewell in the city of Ushuaia. We provide
a group transfer to the airport or to the town center if you wish to
spend more time here. As you look back on your wonderful
experience, you may already be looking forward to your next
incredible polar adventure!

Please note:

Itineraries are subject to change.
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YOUR SHIP: SEA SPIRIT

YOUR SHIP: Sea Spirit

VESSEL TYPE:

LENGTH:

PASSENGER CAPACITY:

BUILT/REFURBISHED:

Sea Spirit is a luxury expedition cruise ship, specifically
designed to cruise the Polar regions. Carrying a maximum of just
114 passengers in 57 suites, she has the feel of a boutique
hotel. Built in 1992, but refurbished several times since, the
latest being in 2019, she is just 90 metres long so can navigate
the small channels and bays of the Polar regions. Sailing aboard
the remarkably comfortable Sea Spirit you will experience the
polar regions in grand style with spacious suites. Sea Spirit's
spacious suites all have panoramic oceans views. Think
king-size or twin beds, en suites, flat screen TVs and DVDs and
internet satellite. Many suites have private balconies, lounge
areas & dressing tables. There is a lounge, bistro and bar, hot
tub, gym, a state-of-the-art presentation room and stabilisers for
smooth cruising. There is an open bridge policy so you can join
the captain and the officers at any time of day to watch the
ship's operations or just check your exact location. Features
All-suite ship Smallest suite is a spacious 215 square feet. 15
suites have balconies. Owner's Suite is an outstanding 550 sq.
feet. Flat Screen TVs and DVD players in every suite Gymnasium
and Hot Tub with seating area and Bistro Library/Games Room
Tea & Coffee Station(24 hrs) Elevator Every suite has an exterior

view Some cabin plans may vary depending on the cruise,
please check for details. Zodiac dockSuperior Suite Owners

Suite Library
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INSIDE YOUR SHIP

Classic Suite Deluxe Suite

Main Deck Suite Owner’s Suite

Premium Suite Single Suite

Superior Suite Triple Classic
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PRICING

21-Oct-2025 to 10-Nov-2025

Deluxe Suite £19020 GBP pp

Premium Suite £20499 GBP pp

Owner’s Suite £25905 GBP pp

Classic Suite £16827 GBP pp

Triple Classic £11829 GBP pp

Single Suite £23559 GBP pp

Superior Suite £17082 GBP pp

Main Deck Suite £15654 GBP pp

23-Oct-2026 to 10-Nov-2026

Single Suite £25089 GBP pp

Owner’s Suite £27539 GBP pp

Classic Suite £17949 GBP pp

Deluxe Suite £20295 GBP pp

Premium Suite £21825 GBP pp

Superior Suite £18255 GBP pp

Main Deck Suite £16725 GBP pp

Triple Classic £12699 GBP pp


