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ARCTIC CRUISE IN SVALBARD, GREENLAND AND ICELAND

Embark on an extraordinary Arctic cruise in Svalbard, Greenland,
and Iceland, beginning your journey in Longyearbyen, the
world's most northerly town, and concluding in Reykjavik. This
luxurious cruise guides you from the icy grandeur of Svalbard's
glaciers to the dynamic landscapes of Greenland and the
geothermal wonders of Iceland. During your voyage, you'll
encounter remarkable locations. Explore Svalbard's polar bear
territory, the volcanic landscapes of Jan Mayen Island, and
Greenland's Scoresby Sund fjord network with its majestic
scenery. In Iceland, discover the vibrant town of Isafjordur, the
serene Vigur Island, and the stunning Dynjandi Waterfall. The
bustling capital, Reykjavik, offers cultural landmarks such as
Hallgrimskirkja and Harpa Concert Hall. This luxury Arctic cruise
promises a range of engaging activities. Immerse yourself in sea
days with expert lectures or perfect your photography skills. Join
optional kayaking excursions in breathtaking fjords, guided by
seasoned experts. With scenic landscapes and captivating
wildlife, this Arctic adventure is an unforgettable journey of
discovery.

ITINERARY

Days 0 - 1 - Pre Cruise & Longyearbyen

The world's most northerly town, Longyearbyen, on Spitsbergen,
Svalbard's largest island, also claims the most northerly high
street and pub. It's home to The North Pole Expeditions Museum
chronicling early pole-reaching efforts by air. Nearby, Svalbard
Global Seed Vault preserves duplicate seeds from gene banks
worldwide. Arctic waters around are populated by whales,
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including bowheads and narwhals, while walruses are regularly
seen hauling out.

Days 2-3 Svalbard

Svalbard is the kingdom of the polar bears, deep in the Arctic
Circle, featuring varied polar landscapes and gargantuan
glaciers. Beyond magnificent fjords in the north, the remaining
sea ice serves as prime hunting grounds for polar bears. Closer
to Longyearbyen, tundra and beaches replace snow and ice.
Alongside 600 polar bears, this Arctic hotspot is home to
walrus, Svalbard reindeer, ringed seals and arctic fox

Days 4-5 Day at sea

Sea days are rarely dull. Take the time to sit back and let the
world go by. The ship's observation decks provide stunning
views of the passing ocean. A day at sea gives you the
opportunity to mingle with other passengers and share your
experiences of this incredible trip or head to our library which is
stocked full of reference books. Get an expert's view in one of
our on-board lectures or perhaps perfect your photography skills
with invaluable advice from our onboard professional
photographers.

Day 6 Jan Mayen Island

The snow-covered stratovolcano Beerenberg dominates the ice
cap and glaciers at the northeast end of Jan Mayen Island.
Halfway between Svalbard and Iceland, this Norwegian island's

only residents are the Norwegian Armed Forces or
meteorological station staff. Purple saxifrage and endemic
dandelions grow next to the black sands, while northern fulmars,
Brunnich's and black guillemots and little auks make Jan Mayen
an important birding area.

Days 7-9 Scoresbysund

The world's largest fjord system, Scoresbysund spans over 350
km into Greenland's heart. This vast network of fjords, glaciers
and icebergs is framed by towering basalt mountains, which
shield Greenland's wildlife from Arctic winds. Muskoxen, Arctic
foxes and mountain hares roam the land, while little auks,
puffins, fulmars, snowy owls, gyrfalcons and great black-backed
gulls soar overhead. Seals and whales are common sightings in
the waters.

Day 9 Ittoqqortoormiit

In the southeastern part of Greenland, the city of
Ittoqqortoormiut appears, on the territory of which only 500
people live. A thick layer of sea ice prevents ships from
approaching the city's port for nine months of the year, so he
arrived in this remote city. Ittoqqortoormiut was founded in
1925 by the Danish explorer Einar Mikkelsen and a group of
about 80 Inuit, covering a vast hunting ground. There is still
hunting and sea fishing. The territory of Ittoqqortoormiit is home
to white foxes, bears and seal colonies.

Day 10 Day at sea
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Sea days are rarely dull. Take the time to sit back and let the
world go by. The ship's observation decks provide stunning
views of the passing ocean. A day at sea gives you the
opportunity to mingle with other passengers and share your
experiences of this incredible trip or head to our library which is
stocked full of reference books. Get an expert's view in one of
our on-board lectures or perhaps perfect your photography skills
with invaluable advice from our onboard professional
photographers.

Day 11 Isafjordur

Surrounded by fjords in the Westfjords region, Ísafjorður is a
bustling fishing town and cultural center in northwest Iceland
with cafes, restaurants and museums. The Heritage Museum,
also known as the Maritime Museum, houses some of the
country's oldest buildings and explores the region's fishing
heritage through compelling exhibits. Nearby, Osvor is a replica
of a 19th-century Icelandic fishing station.

Day 11 Vigur Island

A jewel of the Westfjords, Vigur is the fjord's second-largest
island and a thriving seabird sanctuary. Flocks of arctic terns,
puffins, guillemots and eider ducks nest atop rocky cliffs. As one
of only two inhabited islands, Vigur supports a family farm
continuing the centuries-old eiderdown harvest across 3,500
nests. This remote pillar also houses Iceland's sole windmill, its
tiniest post office and a 200-year-old, still-seaworthy rowing

boat.

Day 12 Dynjandi Waterfall

Considered one of Iceland's most impressive falls, the
thunderous Dynjandi waterfall in the Westfjords region gives the
impression of a bridal veil as it spreads down ever-growing
cascades. The walk takes 15 minutes passing five smaller
waterfalls.

Day 13 Reykjavik

Make sure there is sufficient timeto explore this diminutive but
dramatic capital city. Despite its small size, you won't be short
of things to see and do. To get your bearings, take the elevator
to the top of Hallgrimskirkja. This church, designed by famed
Icelandic architect Gudjon Samuelsson is one of the most
distinctive buildings in town. When you return to earth, visit the
city's other renowned building Harpa Concert Hall, located at the
heart of Reykjavik's regenerated harbour - also the home of the
Maritime Museum. Speaking of cultural spaces, tour the
National Museum to learn the story of Iceland from past to
present. The Reykjavik Art Museum houses an impressive
contemporary collection including eye-catching pieces by Erro.
And, of course, just 50 kilometres outside the city lies Thingvellir
National Park, the site of Iceland's original Viking parliament.

Please note:

Itineraries are subject to change.
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YOUR SHIP: DIANA

YOUR SHIP: Diana

VESSEL TYPE:

LENGTH:

PASSENGER CAPACITY:

BUILT/REFURBISHED:

Launched in 2023, SH Diana provides elegant and spacious
5-star accommodation for 192 guests in 96 spacious
staterooms and suites, the vast majority with large balconies.
Operated by an onboard team of 140 she provides a high level
of personal service, exploring the Mediterranean and its famous
sites of antiquity. Now sit back, relax and take a moment to get
to know this amazing new ship, purpose-designed for our unique
cultural expedition cruises. Named after the Ancient Roman
goddess of light, the moon, hunting and the wilderness, SH
Diana been specially designed for worldwide cruising to explore
the most inspiring and inaccessible places on earth. Building on
the outstanding amenities of her sister ships, she adds a
dedicated Multifunctional Room next to the Observation Lounge,
a Private Dining Room for special occasions, and two tenders
which bring guests a comfortable alternative to Zodiacs for
expedition landings. A Polar Class 6 ice-strengthened hull
combines with extra-large stabilisers to make your journey as
comfortable as possible. SH Diana has been designed for
immersive experiences, with extensive outside deck areas,
multiple observation points and bright, open and relaxing public
spaces with unobstructed views. The pleasure and safety of our

guests is paramount at all times, cared for by our attentive crew
and seasoned expedition leaders. Cutting edge hygiene
technology protects the health of all on board to the highest
standards and includes air conditioning with UV sanitisation
systems. SH Diana's 96 staterooms , including 11 suites, are
each a superbly comfortable home from home and all feature
panoramic sea views, a flame-effect fireplace, original works of
art, plush couches, premium pocket sprung mattresses, en-suite
bathrooms with glass-enclosed rain showers, and Egyptian
cotton towels, bathrobes and sheets. A pillow menu offers
customised head and neck comfort during rest, while a large flat
screen TV, espresso machine with Illy premium coffee, tea
making facilities with the finest Kusmi teas, and a minibar with
refreshments enhance relaxation at any time. In-room dining is
of course available at all hours. Wheelchair access Guests who
use wheelchairs must bring their own, as we have only a small
number of wheelchairs stored onboard for emergencies. To
ensure ease of movement on the ship, wheelchairs and mobility
aids must be no wider than 65cm. All mobility or medical
equipment brought on board must be capable of being carried
safely and must be declared before sailing. To ensure that all
guests can safely evacuate during an emergency, guests
requiring a wheelchair can only be accommodated in our
ADA-accessible cabins. We offer an Oceanview and a Balcony
stateroom on Diana. These staterooms are specifically designed
to be completely ADA compliant and have a fully operable
wheelchair-access wet unit. Diana has two lifts, serving every
passenger deck apart from the Stargazing top deck, which is,
therefore, more difficult to access, as are the Aft Marina and
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Swan's Nest forward observation platform. Also, we don't have
special equipment to access the swimming pool, jacuzzi, or
sauna. Otherwise, the ship is entirely at your disposal. Many of
the expeditions ashore in remote places are by Zodiac. Boarding
these boats and returning aboard can present challenges for
wheelchair users, as can navigating uneven terrain. These
challenges are by no means always insurmountable, though,
and our highly experienced crew is trained to provide reliable
advice and assistance. They will make every effort to ensure
wheelchair-using guests enjoy a memorable experience at each
destination. Our general guidance, however, is to recommend
wheelchair users travel with a companion for their ease and
enjoyment. If you prefer to remain aboard, our panoramic
interiors and ample open decks ensure an immersive, intimate
experience of your inspiring

surroundings.
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INSIDE YOUR SHIP

Balcony D5 Balcony D6

Balcony M5 Junior Suite

Oceanview D4 Oceanview M4

Premium Suite Suite
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PRICING

17-Jul-2026 to 30-Jul-2026

Junior Suite £20289 GBP pp

Balcony D6 £17585 GBP pp

Balcony M5 £16925 GBP pp

Balcony D5 £16259 GBP pp

Premium Suite £27025 GBP pp

Oceanview M4 £14219 GBP pp

Oceanview D4 £13559 GBP pp

Suite £23705 GBP pp


